
Bridport Cohousing - affordable eco-homes for 
sale or rent - coming soon!! 

 

We have at last begun the process of building the affordable 
neighbourhood of sustainable eco-homes that has been in the 
planning stages for so long. The first phase of off-plan houses 
and flats are being released in a few weeks time for leasehold 
purchase at 80% of open market value, and members of 
Bridport Cohousing Community Land Trust will at last be able 
to look forward to our dream becoming a reality, as we 
anticipate starting the groundworks in December and building 
the timber frame modular homes and common house by mid 
summer 2019. 

 

The first step towards owning or renting one of these beautiful 
architect designed homes, situated on the northwest edge of 
Bridport and surrounded by delightful Dorset countryside, is to 
have a look at what the benefits of living in cohousing might 
mean for you and to become a member of the CLT. We hold 
regular events for people who may be curious to learn about 
living in a neighbourhood where it is made easy for families 
and individuals to come together to enjoy shared activities like 
eating together and community gardening, while at the same 
time enjoying their own personal space, whenever they need it, 
and private self contained accommodation.  
 

Keep a lookout on our website and Facebook page for events 
and for more news at the end of October, when the sales 

brochure will be available and sign up to our newsletter or 
phone 07907 993 587 for more information. 
 


